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The figures in the margin indicate full marks for the questions

ALLOTMENT OF MARKS

Q. No. 1(a—f) carries 1 mark each

Q. Nos. 2 to 5§ carry 2 marks each
Q. Nos. 6 to 9 carry 3 marks each
Q. Nos. 10 to 15 carry 5 marks each

Q. Nos. 16 to 18 carry 8 marks each
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1x6 = 6
ox4 = 8
3x4 = 12
5x6 = 30

8x3 =24

Total = 80
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1. Answer the following as directed : 1x6=6

oo frmaR et SR Tee o

(a) Accounting starts where Book-keeping
' ( Fill in the blank with

appropriate word/words )
fRoreRr wIRs =W ¥’ R =7 |
( ToYS =M WA 91X o[ I )

(b) Building is Account.
( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word/words )
T [ERLECE
( TogS e el IR o[/ 1)

(c) “All events are transactions, but all transactions are
not events.”

( State whether the statement
is True or False )

ST WO (T =W, T FICE e 9o 9= 1
( &0 wm (9T SrE 91 )

(d) Purchases Book records all purchases.

( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word/words )

FRRS S & [Ape A |
( TS *CI YAl SR [T 90 )
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(e) Depreciation is a loss in the value of assets.

( State whether the statement
is True or False )

ST TS TR o1 BT TP = |
( SfREChr w7 (1 weE SeEy 41 )

() In India, Goods and Services Tax was introduced with
effect from the date .

( Fill in the blank with
appropriate word/words )

SIEICEC TIRYT °[1 I8 WF CHRI I IS = |
( Soig *RcI YN iR °[@T 1)
2. Mention any two objetives of Goods and Services Tax. 2

W WF G F9 R @Al 751 S Tead 341 |

3. What is GAAP? 2
GAAP it & =2 |

4. Mention any two features of a voucher. 2
eriererad R Gl ¥o1 M8 Teay 4 |

5. What is Trial Balance? 2
Tge-femea i & =2

6. Explain any three causes of depreciation. 3

S R e TR F1Re T 0
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Or / 7%

Explain any three distinctions between Provision and
Reserve.
SRY T WF R e 471 R e RO onefw amm w4 |

7. Explain any three distinctions between a Bill of Exchange
and a Promissory Note.

Rt S SHeRR e o R @ e fSRo «nfs amm 331 1
Or / 9131

Briefly explain the meaning of accommodation bill.
Accommodation bill I S SF [ I |

8. Explain any three distinctions between Capital
Expenditure and Revenue Expenditure.

A4 6 SF AT Y6 Nwe 71 R @i oW1 oz v 3= 1
Or / «iz3r

Briefly explain the meaning of marshalling of assets and
liabilities in Balance Sheet.

BTG~ AT® 411 §F (R RAOPReR S 5L 1 347 |

9. Explain any three disadvantages of accounting from
incomplete records.

1o F(A9GR 71 Rorerra’ R e A5 spifer mam w41
Or / 7i&r

Explain any three distinctions between Double-entry
System and Single-entry System of Book-keeping.
R re-aikift &S 9 g3-aikif mfet e = R @
SRET *fr<fesy amm 1 1
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10. Explain any five distinctions between Manual Accounting
and Computerized Accounting. S

e Tl R wF IRoRTe RprreR Twe 41 R e <o
10T [T AT '

Or / 31

Briefly explain the role of computer in accounting.

PR FRATHRI SR 50T W0 41 |

11. Mention any five advantages of database management
system. 5

SR <Rt +mfed R e <Aor 3R Sy 341
Or / 7igd1

Write a brief note on the structure of database
management system (DBMS).

SURNES ARG TafSq o167 STFCh Qb1 5 COr forn o

12. Explain any five distinctions between Cash basis and
" Accrual basis of accounting. 5

B R wF et Wme w3t R @A #mhl Y
SNl

Or / 7231

What is Balance Sheet? Explain any three needs of
Balance Sheet. 2+3=5

Tre-oig & W2 Tge-oa] R e BRo ecasaiwst 3 10 |
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13. Pass Journal Entries to rectify the following errors : )

TR SARER WA IR IR T AR

(i) An amount of ¥ 5,000 was received for rent from Hari
but was wrongly credited to Hari’s Personal Account.

2RI *[/1 SR I”W 5,000 T S o iR, g peice ¢,
3R fsrs Rorere s 31 2R |

(i) An amount of ¥ 3,000 was paid for repairs to motorcar
was debited to Motorcar Account as ¥ 5,000.

WY RS I 3,000 B wmw frw 2fRE s Gmn
648 Berers 5,000 531 (o T C2fRa |

Or / &
Explain the meaning and uses of Suspense Account.
3+2=5
Suspense Account I ¥ S FLIR IJ T |

14. Naren drew a bill on Haren for ¥ 10,000 payable after three
months. Haren accepted the bill. Show Journal Entries in
the books of Naren under each of the following
circumstances, if the bill is honoured on due date : 5

TEE I e o =’ Porze s figersia 10,000 B3R @t [{e
[ | I Rerse Figfe ami e | Rew s figesm ofks
W Gt 4fRee were T ererechl weEre weaw Ak o

(i) Naren retains the bill till the due date
A& “Reny IR widtacs R el wsre AR

(i) Naren discounts the bill with his banker for ¥9,500
Fa 9,500 53T Repz (967 (@I A9S AT IR
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(i) Naren endorses the bill to his creditor Amitav in
settlement of his debt

AR 49 ARNGI I (D€ ANSAMR T ersle [+ 2@w [

(iv) Naren sends the bill to his banker for collection
A TR FIR A e (067 (RS (2391 IR

Or / 73T

Explain the qualitative characteristics of Accounting
Information.

f2oIoae Y| Qasre CAMBIRR I T4 |

15. Jagadish, who maintains his books under Single-entry
System, started business on 1st April, 2021 with ¥ 50,000
as his capital. Immediately, he purchased furniture worth
¥ 12,000. During the year, he took loan from his wife
¥ 30,000 and he himself introduced additional capital of
¥ 19,000. He withdrew ¥ 1,000 at the end of each month
for his personal expenses. On 31st March, 2022, his
position was as follows :

e @3-l omafoe (o8 RVWER ITHNETI IE | (08
50,000 51 Yeix fRoreet o1 131 «fere], 2021 Oif¥ed I Sies 3 |
(o8 BewIe 12,000 591 FoIR SR T T | IR oo (98 F3
°[1 30,000 5 47 =W W Wu9 FER W WoRe Yo Zore
19,000 <1 e Rfvcs 33 1 (of &fS g s 1,000 391¢F
(¢ RSTT Y67 AT WZgT F@ | 31 16, 2022 wiRkye (967 -&fS
oo AR W SR -

T =)
Cash in Hand 2,000
oo AFT F9% 4
Cash at Bank -16,000

(RTS 1 99 4+
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G

Sundry Debtors 29,000

RRy M=

Stock in Trade 40,000

JPTAS TGS 44T

Bills Receivables 10,000

o=

Sundry Creditors 4,000

RRy neamR

Outstandng Salaries ' 1,000

HHTS 1T
Ascertain his profit or loss during the year ended
31st March, 2022. ' S

31 W, 2022 TIRYS BRI IRIOR IMI (96 A® HIAN ETOH
g =

Or / 71341

From the following information, ascertain Total
Purchases :

ToTe frHl O o[, Y6 T AT 390

¥ (6=
Opening Balances :
s ’@W z
Bills Payable 30,000
= el
Creditors 40,000
RISCDIKE
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Closing Balances :
SRS W :
Bills Payable
frzsaa R
Creditors
TSI
Cash paid to creditors during the year

I[OE fooge oneames wmE T =

Bills Payable discharged during the year
IR foge e el s i 2=

Returns Outwards
FOTINARTEAS
Discount Received

AT 2

Cash Purchases
9% &FH

particulars :
wors Al SYPTIRA *[1 @3 FofA-T8ye FomaR) 2@ 791

2022
March 1 Started business with cash

/142

»

9% 4T IPT kS 91 27
2 Deposited cash into bank
QTS AW 44 G 91 2 A

T =)

35,000
45,000
1,60,000
50,000
5,000
2,000

1,00,000

5
¥ =)

50,000

20,000
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March 3
" 4
» 12
» 15
” 20
» 26
® 29
» 31

( 10 )

Bought goods by cheques

&3 ft I T A

Received cash from Rajib
and allowed him discount

G #F AW 4H WM IR R
HF (€T G o T A

Sold goods for cash
% 4 B R s 24

Paid into bank

TS T T A

Paid to Ramu by cheque
and discount received

I T ¢ W T 2
HIF QBT 11 51

Paid rent by cheque
633 ©rvl fuwn 2'4

Drew from bank for office use
RFI 21 AFBF JIRIF qE TR 9N A

Paid salaries in cash
W 4] w9 e 7'

Or / F%1

¥ &)

2,000

1,000
100

5,000
1,000

2,000
200

1,500
1,300

1,500

From the following particulars of Ramendra Barua,

prepare a Bank Reconciliation Statement

31st March, 2022 :
ITE IFIR oo fum RESAT o[ 31 W6, 2022 wiRkR® 99 (&F

e RIS ez w1 :

(i) Bank overdraft as per Cashbook—¥ 6,000

IR SEEA @ SSRYRES—6,000 T
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(ii)

(iii)

(iv)

17. On

(v)
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Cheques issued but not presented for payment to the
bank—% 1,500

o SmE o e 8 RemR I e wRke @ TiR—
1,500 o=

Interest on overdraft ¥250 and bank charges ¥ 100
debited in the Passbook but not recorded in Cashbook

SSRGEEY @[S Yo 250 B WF @&F TR I@ 100 T
AIFS (B F91 (=R 37 AR g ® F41 (@1 AR

Dividend collected and credited by bank in the
Passbook but not recorded in the Cashbook—% 600

@TF IR R IR AT (Fioh IR 32 Ty RGeS 0
(21 A2—600 B '

A cheque of ¥ 1,000 deposited in bank and credited in
the Passbook, but the same was not recorded in the
Cashbook

1,000 53{ 937 (6F (AFS T 9 (B AF A6IFO (& T
L2z g FoRe ARES 1 (@A TR

1st January, 2018, Barua Traders purchased

Machinery for 96,000 and paid ¥ 4,000 carriage charges.
On 1st July, 2020, they purchased another machine
costing ¥30,000. The rate of depreciation charges on
Machinery was 10% per annum on reducing balance
method. Accounts are closed on 31st December each year.

Show Machinery A/c and Depreciation A/c in the books of
Barua Traders for four years up to 2021.

/142
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1 TR, 2018 wiRes 37 Gorf-a 96,000 51 1R Igfs &

I@ §F 4,000 b1 +Rzt =3 Fowd wwm e 1 R, 2020
wRRve @SEmE 30,000 531 R WF 9Ol (o FH I | FHRPEH
safee qRE 10 o TR SF 4 39 W | A= 31 RoR
iRy fRoreR SR I=& =F |

AfSFOR I2S 202 1251cF TR IZTR A IS ool S s 2o

TS |

- Or / 7z

From the following particulars, préepare an Analytical Petty
Cashbook for the week ending 15th of January, 2022 :

woTs Rl SRR °[1 15 QEER], 2022 SRy S@eRl JTYRGR W
93w Regzafefes Y1 omR) o@s 11 :

2022

January 8 Balance of cash in hand with

/142
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the petty cashier
YA (FRLH Yoo T 75 49 T8
Bought postage and stamps
BRI &
Paid for coolie charges
e TR I s o 2
Received from head cashier
T CPRITTY {0 ANG <5 4
Paid for carriage
{3z IR WA T A

Paid for postage
TG IR MR 2

T =)

500

150

100

1,000

120

160
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2022 T (5<)
January 11 Paid for bus fare for office peon 100
IHERR PRAR I =] I8l SR i 2
» 12 Received from head cashier 500

O FRIEFTR °[1 21 oI 4

. 12 Paid for printing and stationery 180

2l S FCARIR T 436

» 13 Paid for cleaning office premises 60
IR (BIFi BIFT IR 43Id

» 14 Paid for taxi hire charges for manager 200
*/fBTEId e (6f3 =1t oA 2'e

# 15 Paid for carriage of goods 170
R AR WA frm T

18. From the following Trial Balance of Sitaram Choudhury as
on 31st March, 2022 and the additional information,
prepare a Trading and Profit & Loss A/c for the year ended
31st March, 2022 and a Balance Sheet as on that date : 8

Prerm Gy were far 31 W6, 2022 wRYS Tge-fFemeg WFE S0
TfRe R [ 31 W6, 2022 SRYE B[ IRFOHR I 9IF @R
A S-S 2519 W T& TiRe 99 8-+ ¥ 4 :

Trial Balance / ©5&-fe=7q

Particulars (R73) & (o) Particulars (R939) T 63)
Opening Stock 10,000 Sales - 80,000
SRR R R
Purchases 70,000 Bills Payable 7,000
& feeram R
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Particulars ([Ra39)
Carriage Inwards

TGS iz

Carriage Outwards

Rewwie ez
Wages

TR

Coal and Gas
YT HIF ST
Salaries

Loy

Office Expenses
FEERR 4I6
Discount

1T

Debtors

(WL

Bad Debts
SRR ¥
Machinery
TZRNfS

Cash in Hand
oS Y| 9T 4
Cash at Bank
TS YF1 A% 49
Furniture
HHIR
Drawings
LIESE
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¥ )

2,000
1,000
5,000
1,000
6,000
1,500
500
24,000
1,000
10,000
1,500
2,000
6,000

1,000

1,42,500

Particulars (R<39)
Purchase Returns
Y (FIR
Creditors
ASImIg
Sundry Receipts
Ry enfes
Bad Debt Recovered
SHERAY YR 2] iy
Interest Received
TS a1y
Commission Received

wRfR ey

Loan
Jy

Capital
PG

¥ =)

10,000
20,000
500
500
500
2,000
5,000

17,000

1,42,500
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Adjustments :
AR :

(i) Closing Stock as on 31st March, 2022 was ¥ 30,000
31 w16, 2022 OIRkRYS AR Fegge #e5 2’5 30,000 5

(i) Depreciation is to be provided as follows :
S weTS A W 4R 90 20

On Machinery @ 10%
TZRNRET 8*® 10%

On Furniture @ 5%
HHIRI 8% 5%

(iii) Outstanding Salaries ¥2,000 and Prepaid Wages
1,000

Hewa w9l 2,000 591 oF SEy owe wgR 1,000 53

* %k %
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